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TechSource to Provide Subject Matter and Technical Expertise through the Recently 
Awarded Los Alamos National Laboratory Management and Operating Contract  

Los Alamos, NM.  As a member of the TRIAD Team, TechSource is pleased to announce that TRIAD National 
Security, LLC (TRIAD) has been awarded the Los Alamos National Laboratory Management and Operating 
Contract (LANL M&O) by the Department of Energy’s National Nuclear Security Administration (DOE/NNSA).  The 
contract includes a five-year base with five one-year options, for a total of 10 years if all options are exercised. The 
estimated value of the contract is $2.5 billion annually. 

TRIAD is a nonprofit, public service-focused organization specifically created to conduct the LANL M&O work over 
the next 10 years.  The highly experienced and dedicated TRIAD Team is comprised of thought leaders and 
innovators in their respective fields including: Battelle Memorial Institute, Texas A&M University, University of 
California, Fluor Federal Services, Huntington Ingalls Industries/Stoller Newport News, TechSource, Longenecker 
& Associates, and Merrick. 

TechSource will provide subject matter expertise and technical support, as needed, in the performance of pit 
manufacturing, plutonium operations, and other mission areas. 

President and CEO V. Brian D’Andrea, said, “We are elated to be part of the TRIAD Team and to support LANL's 
national security responsibilities.  TechSource has been supporting LANL for over 20 years and fully understands 
the importance and complexity of the LANL mission.  TechSource has built an unmatched cohort of senior experts, 
most with 35 or more years of expertise in domains directly related to LANL’s mission areas of nuclear weapons, 
global security, science, and key operations areas. We look forward to the expanded role and to contributing to 
TRIAD’s and LANL’s success.” 

About TechSource 

TechSource is a leading high-technology science and engineering small business offering recognized expertise in 
accelerator physics, nuclear sciences, engineering, systems engineering integration, and program and project 
management. TechSource’s talented and innovative cohort is comprised of experts, most with 35 years or more of 
hands-on experience. TechSource offers policy to test bench technical and management services in coordination 
with point of interest expertise to organizations responsible for developing, implementing, operating, and managing 
high-technology programs nationwide. For over 20 years TechSource has successfully supported a diverse and 
expanding client base, including U.S. federal agencies, the national laboratories, the Navajo Nation, and commercial 
entities focused on solving some of the most complex issues facing the U.S. today. TechSource is recognized as 
an independent, qualified expert whose advice and products uniquely and effectively bridge technical and 
programmatic requirements. 
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